G.S.Mandal’s
Marathwada Institute of Technology, CIDCO, Aurangabad

Steps for Sanctioning Funds

e After Approved by Principal, application will be forworded to
account for funding

Applicant

e After Approved by Director and Principal,
application will be forworded to account
department for funding

-

Recommended by
Respected Head of

PRINCIPAL
M.\.T. Cidco, Aurangabad
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MIT CIDCO (IT) AURANGABAD

Payment Voucher

Dated : 21-Sep-2023

No. : 154
— Lo e Tl T Amount

Particulars e e -

Account :
] Workshop & Seminar 2,000.00

Through :
HDFC BANK 50200049971106

On Account of :
Being Ch.No. 000531 paid against remuneration charges for workshop on " Cyber Security and

Cyber Awareness " to Dr. Charansing Kayte as per enclosed application
Amount (in words) :

indian Rupees Two Thousand Only _
~%2,000.00

‘ EBC::V\JJ_W;L oY
RMignature: C@ ‘ Authorised Signatory
2025 PRINCIPAL

2\~ 05~
M.L.T. Cidco, Aurangabad,



9/3/24, 2:35 PM Mail - Principal CIDCO - Outiook

Re: FDP on 10T and Arduino for MIT CIDCO staff

Principal CIDCO <principal.mitc@mit.asia>
Mon 10/23/2023 5:03 PM

To:Munish Sharma <munish.sharma@mit.asia>
CcMIT Institute of Emerging Science and Technology, Aurangabad <nitin.bhalkikar@mit.asia>

Thank you sir

Get Qutlook for Android

From: Munish Sharma <munish.sharma@mit.asia>

Sent: Monday, October 23, 2023 4:58:54 PM

To: Principal CIDCO <principal.mitc@mit.asia>

Cc: MIT Institute of Emerging Science and Technology, Aurangabad <nitin.bhalkikar@mit.asia>
Subject: Re: FDP on 10T and Arduino for MIT CIDCO staff

Approved

Get Qutlook for i0S

From: Principal CIDCO <principal.mitc@mit.asia>

Sent: Monday, October 23, 2023 11:28:16 AM

To: Munish Sharma <munish.sharma@mit.asia>

Cc: MIT Institute of Emerging Science and Technology, Aurangabad <nitin.bhalkikar@mitasia>
Subject: FDP on 10T and Arduino for MIT CIDCO staff

Respected sir,

We have planned 5 days FDP on "IOT and Arduino” for MIT CIDCO faculties from 3 to 9 November
2023.

Sir, we selected this topic for FDP as it will be useful for development of projects from students. The
topics covered in this FDP are-

1. Introduction to Arduino and electronics (5 Hrs)
2. Arduino Programming and interfacing (5 Hrs)

3. Advanced Arduino Projects (5 Hrs)

4. 10T connectivity and data handling (5 Hrs)

5. Final Project and Real-world Applications (5 Hrs)

We are have chosen this time for FDP as students will be on Diwali vacations and BAMU

examinations are commencing from 21% November & our Diwali vacations are starting from 10 to 18
Nov 2023.

The renumeration for this FDP to resource person is Rs. 2000 per day i.e. tetal Rs. 10000 for five days.

And we have to purchase 5 Arduino kit (one in five teachers) which will approximately cost Rs. 5000
& it will be useful in future for students projects.
Kind request to grant us total Rs. 15000 expenditure for faculty development.

Thanking you,

Dr. Mahendra H Kondekar

Vice - Principal,

Marathwada Institute of Technology CIDCO, Aurangabad, /
Tel: 0240-2473742 Mob: +91 9822118755

https://outiook office.com/mailid/AAQKAGH NGZjOGMwLTJiZmQtNGI1MCO50DE4LThhMjBmZmI4NjM1YwAQAGs2jTJpdodDipTu1USJeok%3D

12



MIT CIDCO (IT) AURANGABAD

> Payment Voucher
No. : 226 Dated : 6-Nov-2023
~ Paticulars T Amount
Account : |
Atharva A Gaopande | 10,800.00
|
|
|
Through :
HDFC BANK 50200049971106
On Account of :

Being Ch.No. 000571 paid against Robotics + IOT Kit purchase Qty. 04 Nos as per Bill No 202
Dated 06-11-2023. It will be useful in future for students projects

Amount (in words) :
Indian Rupees Ten Thousand Eight Hundred Only |

~ #10,800.00
o~ Cond .
> ) . PRINCIPAL
Receiver's Signature: ox(a" h =2 02D M.LT. Cidﬂmpﬁﬁmm



MIT CIDCO (IT) AURANGABAD

\ Payment Voucher
G y
No. : 218 Dated : 4-Nov-2023
Particulars M . - __ 5= Amount
Account :
STAFF WELFARE 10,000.00
|
|

Through : ‘
HDFC BANK 50200049971106 |
On Account of :

Being Ch.No 000564 Paid to Atharva Aniruddha Gaopande against purchase 5 Arduino Kit (
One in five teachers) it will be useful in future for students projects as per approved letter ‘

Amount (in words) :

Indian Rupees Ten Thousand Only [} Ee——
i ¥10,000.00

<) PRINCIPAL

Receiver's Signature: oh- )-22 3 M.L.T. Ciduoydissasensed



	0b7610126c2b21bdcb1f8709cec7147d3598ea7a34329d900c178f3a88568da1.pdf
	0b7610126c2b21bdcb1f8709cec7147d3598ea7a34329d900c178f3a88568da1.pdf

