G.S.Mandal’s
Marathwada Institute of Technology, CIDCO, Aurangabad

Steps for Sanctioning Funds

e After Approved by Principal, application will be forworded to
account for funding

Applicant

e After Approved by Director and Principal,
application will be forworded to account
department for funding

-

Recommended by
Respected Head of

PRINCIPAL
M.\.T. Cidco, Aurangabad
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MIT CIDCO (IT) AURANGABAD

Payment Voucher

Dated 4-Feb-2023

MNo. - 519
Particulars Amount
Account ;
ADVANCE TO RUTUJA SONTAKKE 1,000.00
Through.:
Cash
On Account of :
Being advance paid to Rutuja Sontakke for Red Hat seminar
Amount (in words) :
Indian Rupees One Thousand Only N_L]
#1,000.00
fmeAe) f:f ;
F‘R! NCIPAL ™~

N
_AX, @}
Vi 2%

ol ¥

Recelvers Signature:

M T, Cideo, Aurannabad
" Althorided Signatory
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MIT CIDCO (IT) AURANGABAD

Payment Voucher

Mo, 501 Oated : 18-Jan-2023

Particulars B _Amount
Account :

ADVANCE VIJAYA PATIL 12,000.00
Through :

HDFC BANK 50200049971106
On Account of :

Being Ch.No. 000345 Paid to Vijaya Patil Against Food and Snacks serve seven days

for NSS Special Camp 2022-23 at Bhambarda as per enclosed application
Amount (in words) :

Indian Rupees Twelve Thousand Only

¥12,000.00
Gaulelear

. S O
g .5l 2.0 ST, €l
Re€eiver's Signature; 1% ol Aut;gﬁgéd%%ﬂa !‘a‘_.fbad



4/8/24, 3:44 PM Mail - Principal CIDCQ - Qutlook

Re: Fitting Curtains in 3 class rooms

Munish Sharma <munish.sharma@mit.asia>
Thu 9/15/2022 6:22 PM
To:Principal CIDCO <principal. mitc@mit.asia>

Approved
Get Qutlook for iOS

From: Principal CIDCO <principal.mitc@mit.asia>
Sent: Thursday, September 15, 2022 12:24:37 PM
To: Munish Sharma <munish.sharma@mit.asia>
Subject: Fitting Curtains in 3 class rooms

Respected sir,

We need to install curtains in C7,C5, and C3 classrooms on top floor at MIT cidco as in these class rooms while
using board and projector the sun light directly comes on board and its not visible to students. There are total

7 class rooms on this floor.

As per discussion with Goti sir | taken Quotation from Shree furnishing and the total approximate expenditure

witl be Rs. 21,150 only.

Kind request to permit us to fit curtains in these class rooms. The quotation is attached herewith.

Thanking you,

Dr. Mahendra H Kondekar

I/C Principal & Assistant Professor,

Marathwada Institute of Technology CIDCO, Aurangabad,
Tel: 0240-2473742 Mob: +91 9822118755

Lrammaudpipie SRR Wiy

MIT

Tt 7 depomn B Rmcen T ey

AURANGABAD

Marethwada Institute of Technology
CIDCO,N-4, Aurangabad - 431003 Moharashtra, INDIA
Accredited with ‘Grade B+’ by NAAC

DISCLAIMER: The content of this email is confidential and intended for the recipient specified in
message only. it is strictly forbidden to share any part of this message with any third party, without
a written consent of the sender. If you received this message by mistake, please reply to this
message and follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur in the
future.

DISCLAIMER: The content of this email is confidential and intended for the recipient specified in
message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part of this message with any third party, without
a written consent of the sender. If you received this message by mistake, please reply to this
message and follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur in the
future.

hitps:/foutlook office.com/mailfid/AAQKAGI 1NGZJOGMWLT JIZmQtNGI1MCO5ODEALT hhMIBmZmI4NjM 1 YwAQAHIB DiruQEZosdjebwy5j%2F1%3D



MIT CIDCO (IT) AURANGABAD - (2021-22)

,

Payment Voucher
b
No. : 271 Dated : 29-Sep-2022
Particulars B 1 Amount
Account :
Shree Fumishing 21,150.00
Through :
FIDFC BANK 50200049971106
On Account of :
Being Ch.No. 000275 paid against Cloth, MS Roed, Bracket, steching of cloth and fitting
charges for various class rooms window cartons as per Bill No 180 Dated 14-09-2022.
Amount {in words) :
Indian Rupees Twenty One Thousand One Hundred Fifty Only
# 21,150.00
- 4
\ Ae— He ) |L.| 1
PV /ﬂﬂ/ PRINCIPAL
Recelver's Signature: “1\_5 . ,_\5_ 6 ¢ N Al Taﬂﬂ%ﬁﬂﬂ?ﬂ?ba



Dabhade Moh. 9860387377

HEDE)

TAX INVOICE

/Shree Furnishing

N-6, N-5, Main Road, Avishkar Colony, Plot No. 474,
Near Rameshwar Medical, CIDCO, Aurangabad.

Sonar Mob. 7020014479

(AII Type Curtain, Cushion, Mattress, Carpet, Sliding Window Works in Wholesale rate )|

> 180

Mo,

Date {g-— M_,J

Qty. | Rat Amount
. ? Rs. Ps.

& BST 2\p0-(

- /!
\2SP QDD“"/
G g (00 ~

G AVD| £DO u{(
Ao S| USDO—<H
é; 5012750 ~b(

ket

GST No. 27AGAPDZ845G1ZH

n TOTAL (4’3_.\ \ gﬁ:&

Rupees (In Words)gwﬁéi?}f é"*dq T &

-
Receiver's Signature

Thank You! For Shree Furnishing

A




4/8/24, 3:39 PM Mail - Principal CIDCO - Outlook

Re: Purchase of New Printer (All in one) for MITC

Munish Sharma <munish.sharma@mit.asia>
Thu 1/5/2023 1:26 PM
To:Principal CIDCO <principal.mitc@mit.asia>

Approved

Get Qutlook for iOS

From: Principal CIDCO <principal.mitc@mit.asia>
Sent: Thursday, January 5, 2023 12:00:19 PM

To: Munish Sharma <munish.sharma@mit.asia>
Subject: Purchase of New Printer {All in one) for MITC

Respected sir,

Our office scanner is not working and it can’t be repaired. Also the canon printer in the office is very old and
multiple times we have to do maintenance of it.

So if we will purchase one new printer ( All in one), it will be very useful to our office.

The Epson EcoTank L3210 A4 All-in-One Ink Tank Printer will be good for us and its cost is approximately Rs.
14,000 as per amazon.

The details of printer(h__t_t;:g[/www,amazon.in/Epson-EcoTank-L3210-Printer-

Black/dp/BOSLSYPF4Y/ref=asc df BOQLSYPF‘lY/?tagEgQQgI_E_S_h_QQQE_S;
21&!inkCodezdfO&hvadid=545029078952&hvpos=&hvnetw=g&hvrand=72101400109‘11249880&hvpone=&hv
ptwo:&thmt:&hvdev:c&hvdwmd!:&hvfocint=&hvlocpﬁy=1007780&hvtargigjpla-1497087074559&th:1)

S0, it is our kind request to permit us purchase it from MIT approved vendor.

Thanking you,

Dr. Mahendra H Kondekar
I/C Principal & Assistant Professor,

Marathwada Institute of Technology CIDCO, Aurangabad,
Tel: 0240-2473742 Mob: +91 9822118755

Srvvadrngh Sitrabae Mooy

a5 R b o R M AARS T T A

1 AURANGABAD

Marathwada Institute of Technology

CIDCO,N-4, Aurangabad - 431 003 Maharashtra, INDIA
Accredited with ‘Grade B’ by NAAC

DISCLAIMER: The content of this email is confidential and intended for the recipient specified in
message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part of this message with any third party, without
a written consent of the sender. If you received this message by mistake, please reply to this
message and follow with its deletion, so that We can ensure such a mistake does not occur in the
future,

DISCLAIMER: The content of this email is confidential and intended for the recipient specified in
message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part of this message with any third party, without



ﬂ G. S. MANDAL’S s
= Bh | et ]
£ q RN ¢ ;3"..:
§ ot Marathwada Institute of Technology CIDCO ”-1@;_%31‘?1:-_;3;;::1"
T N-4, CIDCO, Aurangabad - 431003 Maharashtra, INDIA M

ilﬁe—tmislticn By: Mr. Yashwant Trivikramrao Deshmukh

IPRN No: PRN/23/2569

Requisition Date: 07-Jan-2023

Product Type: Computer Hardware And Software

{Department: Accounts and Establishment |

Brief Justification For Requirement
Colour Printer for office use

——

S.No. Product Company | UOM Quantity |Sanctione Location Delivery '
Name/Service Name d Date
| Quantity
1 Individu 1.0 1 MITC- |
|EPSON L3210 INK al INSTITUTE
TANK ALL IN ONE MAIN
ILDING
COLOUR PRINTER “FIRST
Description; FLOOR-F1

Requisitory Signature
Mr. Yashwant Trivikramrao Deshmukh

)
A

M.L.T. Cidco, Aurangabad

e

N-4, CIDC?AURANGABAD - 431003 MAHARASHTRA, INDIA Page 1



TAX INVOICE

/:: ,/.
/| SUXOG ENTERPRISES Hfivoics No. Dated
| Shop No. 8 Costa Mapie ( CS5/0482/22-23 13-Jan-23
| Mear SSC Board Osmanpura Road Delivery Note ~ | ModeiTerms of Payment

Aurangabad

MO-971 585638485

GETIN/UIN: 2FAKCPJO551012F

Staté Mame : Maharashtra, Code : 27
EAall : suyog.computer14@gmail.com

Referance No. & Date.

Diher Referances

Consignee (Ship to) Buyer's Order No. Dated
3 iy :
{i Principal MIT CIDCO AURANGABAD =
CIDCO , AURANGABAD Dispatch Doc No, Delivery Note Dale
| GSTIN/UIN : 2TAAATGZ20430C220
State Name : Maharashtra, Code : 27 Dispatched through Destination
Vishal
Terms of Delivery
Buyer (Bill to)
Principai MIT CIDCO AURANGABAD
CIDCO , AURANGABAD
GSTIN/UIN . : 27AAATG2943C2Z0
State Name : Maharashtra, Code : 27
Sl Description of Goods HSN/SAC | Quantlly | Rale Rate | per |Disc. % Amount
e S |ingettTan)|
(’f1 PRINTER EPSON L3210 84433100 </ 1 Nas /;2.-?430.00 f__A/Il'.!,?ﬁzf.r'1 Nos e 10,762.71
CGST OUTPUT 968.64
SGST QUTPUT 968.64
R.OFF 0.01
- Total | 1Nos f Z12,700.00
tymount Chargeable (in words) i E &OE
INR Twelve Thousand Seven Hundred Only
HSN/SAC Taxable | Cenltral Tax Stata Tax Total
Value Rate Amount Rate | Amount | Tax Amount |
84433100 _ 10,76271] 9% 9668.84| 8% 968.64|  1,937.28
Total 10,762.71 968.64 968.64 1,937.28

Tax Amount (inwords) © INR One Thousand Nine Hundred Thirty Seven and Twenty Eight paise Only

Declaration

We deciare that this invoice shows the actual price of the

goods described and that all particulars are true and

carrech

for SUYOG ENTERPRISES

Authotised Signatory

SUBJECT TO AURANGABAD JURISDICTION

This is a

Computer Generated Invoice



MIT CIDCO (IT) AURANGABAD

Payment Voucher
No. : 524 Dated : 13-Feb-2023
~ Particulars L | Amount.
Aceount : |
Suyog Enterprises | 12,700.00
i
|
Through :

HDEC BANK 50200048971108
On Account of & |

Being Ch.No. 000359 paid against Epson L3210 New Brinter Purchase for Principal
GCffice Qty 01 No. as per Bill No 0482 Dated 13-01-2023 ‘

Amount (in words) :
indian Rupees Twelve Thousand Seven Hundred Only ‘ Il
# 12,700.00

iz L el

M |
PRINCIPA
_ﬂ_hﬂ[gi M.ET. ﬁﬂdcﬁ, Auran%abad

Receiver's Signature: I:EJ_‘ o ~2625 horised Signafory




4/8/24, 3:46 PM Mail - Principal CIDCO - Outlook

Re: Purchase of 2 HP TARO TEXMO BOREWELL SUBMERSIBLE PUMP

Munish Sharma <munish.sharma@mit.asia>
Mon 7/25/2022 2:23 PM

To:Principal CIDCO <principal mitc@mit.asia>

Approved.

From: Principal CIDCO <principal.mitc@mit.asia>

Date: Monday, 25 July 2022 at 11:24 AM

To: Munish Sharma <munish.sharma@mit.asia>

Subject: Purchase of 2 HP TARO TEXMO BOREWELL SUBMERSIBLE PUMP

Respected sir,

The submersible pump installed in MIT cidco was before 15 years and its repaired two to three times. But now
its not working.

We need to purchase Texmo 2HP submersible pump costing approximate Rs. 19500 received quotation from
Haridas Sons and others.

As per discussion with Mr. Goti sir, we have requested quotation Suresh Agency also.

Kind request to permit us to purchase and install it as its very urgently required and from last S days there is
water problem in MIT C.

Thanking you,

Dr. Mahendra H Kondekar

I/C Principal & Assistant Professor,

Marathwada Institute of Technology CIDCO, Aurangabad,
Tel: 0240-2473742 Mob; +91 9822118755

Cavamtd SH st Wi
W hona F o whest B Nk S LR

AURAKGABAGD

Marathwada Institute of Teechnology
CIDCO,N-4, Aurangabad - 431003 Maharashtra, INDIA
Accredited with ‘Grade B.’ by NAAC

DISCLAIMER: The content of this email is confidential and intended for the recipient specified in message only.
It is strictly forbidden to share any part of this message with any third party, without a written consent of the
sender. if you received this message by mistake, please reply to this message and follow with its deletion, so
that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur in the future.

DISCLAIMER: The content of this email is confidential and intended for the recipient specified in
message only. It is strictly forbidden to share any part of this message with any third party, without
a written consent of the sender. If you received this message by mistake, please reply to this
message and follow with its deletion, so that we can ensure such a mistake does not occur in the
future.

hitps:/foutleok.office.comimailfid/ AAQKAGINGZ|OGMWLT HZmQINGI {MCO50DE4L ThhMiBmZmI4NjM1 YWAQARSrGEARTOc kOzwBjiplok%3D
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- QUOTATION / PROFORMA INVOICE

/ RUN PUMP DAILY FOR 1 MIN / SS JALI IN INLET
A ( SUNIL AGENCIES Invoice No. Dated
Shop No 5/6,Masjid, Shahgunj,Aurangabad 1 25-Jul-2022
GSTIN/UIN: 27ADEPA8S077A1ZW 7
State Name : Maharashtra, Code : 27 Buyer's Order No. Dated
By QUOTATION 25-Jul-2022
MIT (AURANGANBAD)
BEED BYPASS, AURANGABAD
SSTIN/UIN I 27AAATG2943C22Z0
Sl Description of Goods HSN/SAC | GST | Quaritity Rate per Amount
No. Rate
1]1.5 HP "TEXMO" (Original) SUBMERSIBLE PUMP SE220 8413 18 %| 1 NOS|14,237.29|NOS| 14,237.29
2 |1.5HP S/P SUBMERSIBLE STARTER MCB 8536 18 %| 1 NOS|1,355.93|NOS 1,355.93
3 |2.5MM "AQUATEX" SUBMERSIBLE CABLE 8544 18 % (100 MiTR 93.22|MTR 9,322.00
4 11"X1.25"SS REDUCE BUSH 7307 18 %| 1 NOS| 127.12[NOS 127.12
5/1"SS NIPPLE 7307 18 %| 1 NOS| 203.29(N0S 203.39
) 25,245.73
OUTPUT CGST @ 9% 9| % 2,272.12
OUTPUT SGST @ 9% 9% 2,272.12
ROUNDOFF 0.03
i '/’ 1
e vaval
Total o 1 £-29,790.00
Amount Chargeable (in words) i i E. & O.E
INR Twenty Nine Thousand Seven Hundred Ninety Cnly ' !
Taxable Central Tax. State Tax Total
Value Rate | Amount | Rate | Amount |Tax Amount
25,245.73 9%  2,272.12 9% | 2,272.12| 4,544.24]
Total: 25,245.73 2,272.12 2,272.12| 4,544.24
Tax Amount (inwords) : INR Four Thousand Five Hundred Forty Four and Twenty Four paise Only
i S Company's Bank Details
Declaration Bank Name : STATE BANK OF INDIA (SBI)
Wesédr?c;are that :isainv:iciiusg?svvasrteheruaectau:l pri::reeof the goods A/c No. : 62100251347
s e < SR Branch & IFS Code: Shahgunj,Aurangabad. & SBIN0017554
Customer's Seal and Signature for SUNIL AGENCIES
L
Authoris: T

SUBJECT TO AURANGABAD JURISDICTION
SELF PRIMING PUMP - 8 DAYS TIME TO EXCHANGE



Pumgps you can rely on
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Tax Invoice

RUN PUMP DAILY FOR 1 MIN / SS JALI IN INLET

SELF PRIMING PUMP - 8 DAYS TIME TO EXCHANGE

g
50  d
SUNIL AGENCIES : / Invoice No. Dated /
S=BMail A s Acrengatad SA/22-23/2564 26-Jul-2022
State Name : Maharashtra, Code : 27 Buyer's Order No. Dated
Buyer
MIT (AURANGANBAD) SITE-N4, PO NO- MIT/CIDC0/023 | 25-Jul-2022, 25-Jul-2022
BEED BYPASS, AURANGABAD k
GSTIN/UIN : 27AAATG2943C2Z0 (ZME 9('} 6 :FZ'X‘? %'
Sl Description of Goods HSN/SAC| GST | Quantity Rate per Amount
No. Rate
1([1.5 HP "TEXMO" (Originai) SUBMERSIBLE PUMP SE220 8413 18 %| 1 NOS| 14,237.29|N0OS 14,237.29
2 11.5HP S/P SUBMERSIBLE STARTER MCB 28536 18 %| 1 NOS|1,355.93|NOS 1,355.93
3 |2.5MM "AQUATEX" SUBMERSIBLE CABLE 8544 18 %100 MTR 93.22|MTR 9,322.00
4 |1"X1.25"SS REDUCE BUSH 7307 18 %| 1 NOS| 127.12|NOS 127.12
5[(1"SS NIPPLE 7307 18 %| 1 NOS| 203.39|NOS 203.38
: 25,245.73
PACKING & FORWARDING 700.C0 [,
, OUTPUT SGST @ 9% 9|% 2,335.11
OQUTPUT CGST @ 9% 9% 2,335.11
ROUNDOFF 0.05
Total |%30,616.00
Amount Chargeable (in words) R ETROE
INR Thirty Thousand Six Hundred Sixteen Onily : ¢
Taxable Central Tax State Tax Total
Value Rate | Amount [ Rate | Amount |Tax Amount
25,845.73 9%| 2,335.11 9%| 2.3835.11] 467022
I Total: 25,945.73 2,335.11 2,335.11| 4,670.22
Tax Amount (inwords) : INR Four Thousand Six Hundred Seventy and Twenty Two paise Only
Remarks: Company's Bank Details
et =L Bank Name : STATE BANK OF !“DIA (SBI)
et e e a1 R e, e L e e it Alc No. : 62100251347
Sarages s st g of e e 0 e e AT impsa et Sieksameedtsminen nvecones, ___BTANCH & IFE Code: $Shahguni,Aurangabad. & SBIN0017554
Customer's Seal and Signature 9 8 9/,2 ‘ ' g m’“ for SUNIL AGE:(KS
s ' SWEA T
L U722 20 £0%Y -&ruthuﬂ&éﬂ@
SUBJECT TO AURANGABAD JURISDICTION ’



